ORDINANCE NO. 1387

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TUSTIN,
CALIFORNIA, AMENDING SPECIFIED SECTIONS OF CHAPTER 1 OF
ARTICLE 5 OF THE TUSTIN CITY CODE TO ADOPT THE 2010
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AS AMENDED THERETO.

The City Council of the City of Tustin does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. Section 5130 of Chapter 1 of Article 5 of the Tustin City Code is deleted
in its entirety and replaced as follows:

5130 ADOPTED

An ordinance of the City of Tustin adopting the California Fire Code, 2010 Edition,
based on the 2009 International Fire Code, regulating and governing the
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the
storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and
from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises in the City of Tustin; providing for the issuance of permits and collection
of fees therefor; repealing Ordinance No. 1345 of the City of Tustin and all other
ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations and governing the safeguarding of life
and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling
and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as
herein provided, the following fire codes subject to the modifications set forth in this
Chapter, are hereby adopted: the California Fire Code, 2010 Edition, based on the
2009 International Fire Code as published by the International Code Council as
amended by this chapter shall constitute the Fire Code (Fire Code) of the City of
Tustin. Where the California Code of Regulations and State Building Standards
Code of Regulations differ from any sections of the Fire Code, State regulations
shall prevail over the Fire Code.

One (1) copy of all the above codes and standards therefore are on file in the office
of the fire code official pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 18942 (d) (1)
and are made available for public inspection.

Notwithstanding the provisions of the above-referenced construction codes, all fees
for services provided pursuant to the Fire Code shall not take effect until a
resolution for such fees is adopted by the Orange County Fire Authority Board of
Directors. o

L

SECTION 2. Section 5131 of Chapter 1 of Article 5 of the Tustin City Code is deleted
in its entirety and replaced as follows:

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 1 of 36



5131 AMENDMENTS TO THE 2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE.

5131.01 Chapter 1, Scope and Administration, of the 2010 California Fire Code is
adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(@)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

Section 105.6.29 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety
and replaced as follows:

105.6.29. Miscellaneous combustible storage. An operational permit is
required to store in any building or upon any premises in excess of 2500
cubic feet (71 m?) gross volume of combustible empty packing cases,
boxes, barrels or similar containers, rubber tires, rubber, cork, green
waste, composting, yard waste, or similar combustible material.

Section 105.6.35 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby deleted without
replacement.

Section 109.3 of the 2010 California Fire Code is amended to read as
follows:

109.3 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who
shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit
or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of either a
misdemeanor, infraction or both as prescribed in Section 109.3.2 and
109.3.3. Penalties shall be as prescribed in local ordinance. Each day
that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense.

Section 109.3 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding Section 109.3.2 to read:

109.3.2 Infraction. Except as provided in Section 109.3.3, persons
operating or maintaining any occupancy, premises or vehicle subject to this
code that shall permit any fire or life safety hazard to exist on premises
under their control shall be guilty of an infraction.

Section 109.3 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding Section 109.3.3 to read:

109.3.3 Misdemeanor. Persons who fail to take immediate action to abate
a fire or life safety hazard when ordered or notified to do so by the chief or a
duly authorized representative, or who violate the following sections of this
code, shall be guiity of a misdemeanor:

104.11.2 Obstructing operations

Ordinance No. 1387

Page 2 of 36



104.11.3 Systems and Devices

107.6 Overcrowding

109.2.2 Compliance with Orders and Notices
111.4 Failure to comply

305.4 Deliberate or negligent burning

308.1.2 Throwing or placing sources of ignition
310.7 Burning Objects

2404.7 Open or exposed flames

5131.02 Chapter 2, Definitions, of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby
adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(@)

Section 202 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding
“Flow-line”, “Hazardous Fire Area” and replacing "High-Rise Building" to
read:

202 General Definitions

FLOW-LINE. Is the lowest continuous elevation on a rolled curb defined
by the path traced by a particle in a moving body of water at the bottom of
the rolled curb.

HAZARDOUS FIRE AREA. Includes all areas identified within Section
4906.2 and other areas as determined by the Fire Code Official due to the
presence of combustible vegetation, or the proximity of the property to an
area that contains combustible vegetation.

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. In other than Group I-2 occupancies “high-rise
buildings” as used by this Code:

1. “Existing high-rise structure” means a high-rise structure, the
construction of which commenced or completed prior to July 1, 1974

2. “High-rise structure” means every building of any type of
construction or occupancy having floor used for human occupancy located
more than55 feet above the lowest floor level having building access
except buildings used as hospitals as defined by the Health and Safety
Code Section 1250.

3. “New high-rise structure” means a high-rise structure, the
construction of which commenced on or after July 1, 1974

5131.03 Chapter 3, General Precautions Against Fire, of the 2010 California Fire
Code is hereby adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(a)

Section 304.1.2 (b) (7) of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby
amended by adding Section “(E)” to read:

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 3 of 36



(E) OCFA Vegetation Management Guideline.

(b) Section 305 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding Section 305.5 to read:

305.5 Chimney spark arrestors. All chimneys attached to any appliance or
fireplace that burns solid fuel shall be equipped with an approved spark
arrestor, the spark arrester shall meet all of the following requirements:

1. The net free area of the spark arrester shall not be less than four
times the net area of the outlet of the chimney.

2. The spark arrester screen shall have heat or corrosion resistance
equivalent to 12 gage steel wire, 19 gage galvanized wire or 24 gage
stainless steel.

3. Openings shall not permit the passage of spheres having a
diameter larger than %z inch and shall not block the passage of spheres
having a_diameter of less than 3/8 inch.

4. The spark arrester shall be accessible for cleaning and the screen
or chimney cap shall be removable to allow for cleaning of the chimney
flue.

(c) Section 318 is hereby added to read as follows:

318 Development On Or Near Land Containing Or Emitting Toxic,
Combustible or Flammable Liquids, Gases or Vapors. The fire code
official may require the submittal for approval of geological studies,
evaluations, reports, remedial recommendations and/or similar
documentation from a state-licensed and department-approved individual
or firm, on any parcel of land to be developed which has, or is adjacent to,
or within 1,000 feet (304.8 m) of a parcel of land that has an active,
inactive, or abandoned oil or gas well operation, petroleum or chemical
refining facility, petroleum or chemical storage, or may contain or give off
toxic, combustible or flammable liquids, gases or vapors.

(d)  Section 319 is hereby added to read as follows:

319 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction. All new
buildings to be built or installed in areas containing combustible vegetation
shall comply with the following:

1. Preliminary fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and
approved by the fire code official concurrent with the submittal for approval
of any tentative map.

2. Final fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and approved by
the fire code official prior to the issuance of a grading permit.

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 4 of 36



(e)

(f)

3. The fuel modification plans shall meet the criteria set forth in the Fuel
Moadification Section of the Orange County Fire Authority Vegetation
Managements Guideline.

4. The fuel modification plan may be altered if conditions change. Any
alterations to the fuel modification areas shall have prior approval by the fire
code official.

5. All elements of the fuel modification plan shall be maintained in
accordance with the approved plan and are subject to the enforcement
process outlined in the Fire Code.

Section 320 is hereby added to read as follows:

320 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways. The fire code
official is authorized to cause areas within 10 feet (3048 mm) on each side
of portions of highways and private streets which are improved, designed or
ordinarily used for vehicular traffic, to be cleared of flammable vegetation
and other combustible growth. Measurement shall be from the flow-line or
the end of the improved edge of the roadway surfaces.

Exception: Single specimens of trees, ornamental shrubbery or cultivated
ground cover such as green grass, ivy, succulents or similar plants used as
ground covers, provided that they do not form a means of readily
transmitting fire.

Section 321 is hereby added to read as follows:

321 Unusual circumstances. The fire code official may suspend
enforcement of the vegetation management requirements and require
reasonable alternative measures designed to advance the purpose of this
code if determined that in any specific case that any of the following
conditions exist:

1. Difficult terrain.
2. Danger of erosion.
3. Presence of plants included in any state and federal resources

agencies, California Native Plant Society and county-approved list of
wildlife, plants, rare, endangered and/or threatened species.

4. Stands or groves of trees or heritage trees.

5. Other unusual circumstances that make strict compliance with the
clearance of vegetation provisions undesirable or impractical.

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 5 of 36



(9)

(h)

Section 322 is hereby added to read as follows:

322 Use of equipment. Except as otherwise provided in this section, no
person shall use, operate, or cause to be operated, in, upon or adjoining
any hazardous fire area any internal combustion engine which uses
hydrocarbon fuels, unless the engine is equipped with a spark arrester as
defined in Section 322.1 and maintained in effective working order, or the
engine is constructed, equipped and maintained for the prevention of fire.

Exception:

1. Engines used to provide motor power for trucks, truck tractors,
buses, and passenger vehicles, except motorcycles, are not subject to this
section if the exhaust system is equipped with a muffler as defined in the
California Vehicle Code.

2. Turbocharged engines are not subject to this section if all exhausted
gases pass through the rotating turbine wheel, there is no exhaust bypass
to the atmosphere, and the turbocharger is in good mechanical condition

322.1 Spark arrestors. Spark arrestors shall comply with the following:

1. A spark arrester is a device constructed of nonflammable material
specifically for the purpose of removing and retaining carbon and other
flammable particles over 0.0232 of an inch (0.58 mm) in size from the
exhaust flow of an internal combustion engine that uses hydrocarbon fuels
or which is qualified and rated by the United States Forest Service.

2. Spark arresters affixed to the exhaust system of engines or vehicles
subject to Section 322 shall not be placed or mounted in such a manner as
to allow flames or heat from the exhaust system to ignite any flammable
material.

Section 323 is hereby added to read as follows:

323 Restricted Entry. The fire code official shall determine and publicly
announce when hazardous fire areas shall be closed to entry and when
such areas shall again be opened to entry. Entry on and occupation of
hazardous fire areas, except public roadways, inhabited areas or
established trails and camp sites which have not been closed during such
time when the hazardous fire area is closed to entry, is prohibited.

Exception:

1. Residents and owners of private property within hazardous fire areas
and their invitees and guests going to or being upon their lands.

Ordinance No. 1387

Page 6 of 36



()

2. Entry, in the course of duty, by peace or police officers, and other
duly authorized public officers, members of a fire department and members
of the United States Forest Service.

Section 324 is hereby added to read as follows:

324 Trespassing on posted property. When the fire code official determines
that a specific area within a hazardous fire area presents an exceptional
and continuing fire danger because of the density of natural growth,
difficulty of terrain, proximity to structures or accessibility to the public, such
areas shall be closed until changed conditions warrant termination of
closure. Such areas shall be posted as hereinafter provided.

1. Signs. Approved signs prohibiting entry by unauthorized persons and
referring to applicable Fire Code chapters shall be placed on every closed
area.

2. Trespassing. Entering and remaining within areas closed and posted
is prohibited.

Exception: Owners and occupiers of private or public property within closed
and posted areas, their guests or invitees, and local, state and federal
public officers and their authorized agents acting in the course of duty.

Section 325 is hereby added to read as follows:

325 Outdoor fires. Outdoor fires shall not be built, ignited or maintained in or
upon hazardous fire areas, except by permit from the fire code official.

Exception: Outdoor fires within habited premises or designated campsites
where such fires are built in a permanent barbecue, portable barbecue,
outdoor fireplace, incinerator or grill and are a minimum of 30 feet (9144
mm) from a grass, grain, brush, or forest-covered area. Permanent
barbecues, portable barbecues, outdoor fireplaces or grills shall not be used
for the disposal of rubbish, trash or combustible waste material.

325.1 Outdoor fire permits. Outdoor fire permits shall incorporate such
terms and conditions which will reasonably safeguard public safety and
property. Outdoor fires shall not be built, ignited or maintained in or upon
hazardous fire areas under the following conditions:

1. When predicted sustained winds exceed 20 MPH at the ground
level, or a red flag condition has been declared,

2. When a person age 17 or over is not present at all times to watch
and tend such fire, or

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 7 of 36



3. When a public announcement is made that open burning is
prohibited.

5131.04 Chapter 4, Emergency Planning and Preparedness, of the 2010
California Fire Code is hereby adopted and amended by deleting Sections 404, 405,
406, and 408.

5131.05 Chapter 5, Fire Service Features, of the 2010 California Fire Code is
hereby adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(a)

(b)

(€)

(d)

(e)

Section 503.1.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is amended by adding
Exception 4 to read:

Exception:

4. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3 the fire apparatus access road shall
comply with the requirements of this section and shall extend to within 300
feet (91 m) of the main entry door to the building.

Section 503.2.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding the following to the end of the section to read:

Street widths are to be measured from top face of curb to top face of curb,
on streets with curb and gutter, and from flow-line to flow-line on streets
with rolled curbs.

Section 503.2.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding Section 503.2.1.1 to read:

503.2.1.1 Hazardous Areas. In areas defined as State Responsibility Area:
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, and Local Responsibility Area:
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones Area, as adopted by the local
agencies, the minimum fire apparatus road width shall be 28 feet (8.53 m).

Exception: When the road serves no more than 3 dwelling units and the

road does not exceed 150 feet (45.7 m) in length, the road width may be
24 feet (7.3 m).

Section 503.4 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding the following to the end of the section to read:

Speed Bumps and speed humps shall be approved prior to installation.

Section 503.6 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding the following to the end of the section to read:

Ordinance No. 1387

Page 8 of 36



(f)

(9

(h)

Vehicle access gates or barriers shall be in accordance with the Orange
County Fire Authority Guidelines “Fire Master Plan for Commercial and

Residential Development”. All electrically operated vehicle access gates
shall be equipped with an automatic opening device in addition to a key
opening switch.

Section 505.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby deleted in its
entirety and replaced as follows:

505.1 Address identification. New and existing buildings shall have
approved address numbers, building numbers or approved building
identification placed in a position that is plainly legible and visible from the
street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with
their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or
alphabetical letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm)
high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) for R-3
occupancies. For all other occupancies the numbers shall be a minimum
of 6 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 1 inch. Where access is
by a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a
monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the
structure.

Section 507.5.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety
and replaced as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building
hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than
the distance allowed for in APPENDIX C — FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS
AND DISTRIBUTION from a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as
measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required
by the fire code official.

Exception:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies equipped throughout with
an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3, the distance requirement
shall be not more than 600 feet (183 m).

Section 510.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read
as follows:

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in buildings. All new buildings
shall have radio coverage for emergency responders in accordance with
the City’s In-Building Public Safety Radio System Coverage ordinance
(Ordinance 1337).

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 9 of 36



(i

Exceptions: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the radio
coverage system is not needed.

Section 510.2 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby deleted without
replacement.

5131.06 Chapter 6, Building Service and Systems, of the 2010 California Fire
Code is adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(@)

(b)

(c)

(d)

Section 604.2.15.1.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby deleted
and replaced as follows:

[B] 604.2.15.1.1 Standby power loads. The following loads are classified
as standby power loads:

1. Smoke control system.
2. Fire pumps.

3. Standby power shall be provided for elevators in accordance with
Section 3003 of the California Building Code.

Section 604.2.15.2.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended
by adding item 6 to read:

6. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smoke proof
enclosures.

Section 606.8 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced as
follows:

606.8 Refrigerant Detector. Machinery rooms shall contain a refrigerant
detector with an audible and visual alarm. The detector, or a sampling
tube that draws air to the detector, shall be located in an area where
refrigerant from a leak will concentrate. The alarm shall be actuated at a
value not greater than the corresponding TLV-TWA values shown in the
California Mechanical Code for the refrigerant classification. Detectors and
alarms shall be placed in approved locations. Emergency shutoff shall
also be automatically activated when the concentration of refrigerant vapor
exceeds 25 percent of LFL. The detector shall transmit a signal to an
approved location.

Section 606.10.1.2 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding the following to the end of the section to read:

The manual valves shall be located in an approved location immediately
outside of the machinery room and in a secure metal box or equivalent
and marked as Emergency Controls.

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 10 of 36



(e) Section 608.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding the following to the end of the section to read:

Indoor charging of electric carts/cars with more than 50 gallons (189 L)
shall comply with Section 608.10.

® Section 608 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding Section 608.10 to read:

608.10 Indoor charging of electric carts/cars. Indoor charging of
electric carts/cars where the combined volume of all electric/cars battery
electrolyte exceeds 50 gallons shall comply with following:

1. Spill control and neutralization shall be provided and comply with
Section 608.5.

2. Room ventilation shall be provided and comply with Section 608.6.1
3. Signage shall be provided and comply with Section 608.7

4. Smoke detection shall be provided and comply with Section 907.2

(g9) Section 610 is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 610
PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS

610.1 Manual operation. Photovoltaic systems shall comply with Orange
County Fire Chief's Association Guideline for Fire Safety Elements of
Solar Photovoltaic Systems. The provision of this section may be applied
by either the fire code official or the building code official.

5131.07 Chapter 7, Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction, of the 2010 California
Fire Code is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

5131.08 Chapter 8, Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings, of the
2010 California Fire Code - only the Sections and Subsections listed below are adopted
herein:

Section 801
Section 802
Section 803
Section 804
Subsection 806.2

ohRON=

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 11 of 36



6. Subsection 807.1

7. Subsection 807.1.2

8 Subsection 807.4.5.1
9. Subsection 807.4.2.4.1
10. Subsection 807.4.5
11.  Subsection 807.4.2.4
12. Table 803.3

5131.09 Chapter 9, Fire Protection Systems, of the 2010 California Fire Code is
hereby adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(a)

(b)

Section 903.2 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced as
follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in buildings
and structures shall be provided when one of the following conditions
exists

1. New buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of
Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12, an automatic fire-extinguishing system
shall also be installed in all occupancies when the total building area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 mz) as defined in Section 202, regardless
of fire areas or allowable area.

Exception: Group R-3 occupancies. Group R-3 occupancies shall comply
with Section 903.2.8.

2. Existing Buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of this
code, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in an existing
building when an addition occurs and when one of the following conditions
exists:

a. When an addition is 33% or more of the existing building area, and
the resulting building area exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?) as
defined in Section 202; or

b. When an addition exceeds 2,000 square feet (186 m?) and the
resulting building area exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?) as
defined in Section 202.

Exception: Group R-3 occupancies

Section 903.3.1.1.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended
by revising Exception 4 to read:

Exception:

4, When approved by the fire code official, spaces or areas in
telecommunications buildings used exclusively for telecommunications

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 12 of 36



()

(d)

(€)

equipment and associated electrical power distribution equipment,
provided those spaces or areas are equipped throughout with an
automatic smoke detection system in accordance with Section 907.2 and
are separated from the remainder of the building by fire barriers consisting
of not less than 1-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section
707 or not less than 2-hour horizontal assemblies constructed in
accordance with Section 712, or both.

Section 903.4 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
modifying Exception 1, deleting Exceptions 3 and 5, and renumbering the
Exceptions as follows:

1. Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one- and two-family
dwellings.

2. Limited area systems serving fewer than 20 sprinklers.

3. Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open
position.

4. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are

sealed or locked in the open position.

5. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, preaction and deluge
sprinkler systems that are sealed or locked in the open position.

Section 904.3.5 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced
as follows:

904.3.5 Monitoring. Where a building fire alarm or monitoring system is
installed, automatic fire-extinguishing systems shall be monitored by the
building fire alarm or monitoring system in accordance with NFPA 72.

Section 905.4 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding items 7 and 8 to read:

7. The centerline of the 2.5 inch (63.5 mm) outlet shall be no less than
18 inches (457.2 mm) above and no more than 24 inches above the
finished floor.

8. Every new building with any horizontal dimensions greater than 300
feet (91 440 mm) shall be provided with either access doors at the grade
level or a 2.5 inch (64 mm) hose outlets. Required access doors shall be
located in the exterior of the building and shall be accessible without the
use of a ladder. The door dimensions shall be not less than 3 feet (914
mm) in width, and not less than 6 feet 8 inches (2032 mm) in height.
These doors are for fire department access only and need not meet other
requirements of this code.

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 13 of 36



1)) Section 907.2.13 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced
as follows:

907.2.13 High-rise buildings having occupied floors located more than 55
feet (16 769 mm) above the lowest level of Fire Department vehicle
access and Group |I-2 occupancies having floors located more than 75
feet (22 860 mm) above the lowest level fire department vehicle access.
High-rise buildings having occupied floors located more than 55 feet (16
769 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access and
Group I-2 occupancies having floors located more than 75 feet (22 860
mm) above the lowest level fire department vehicle access shall be
provided with an automatic smoke detection in accordance with Section
907.2.13.1, a fire department communication system in accordance with
Section 907.2.13.2 and an emergency voice/alarm communication system
in accordance with Section 907.6.2.2.

Exceptions:

1. Airport traffic control towers in accordance with Section 907.2.22
and Section 412 of the California Building Code.

2. Open parking garages in accordance with Section 406.3 of the
California Building Code.

3. Buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in accordance with
Section 303.1 of the California Building Code.

4, Low-hazard special occupancies in accordance with Section
503.1.1 of the California Building Code.

5. In Group I-2 and R-2.1 occupancies, the alarm shall sound at a
constantly attended location and general occupant notification shall be
broadcast by the emergency voice/alarm communication system.

(g9  Section 907.4.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced
as follows:

907.4.1 Duct smoke detectors. Smoke detectors installed in ducts shall be
listed for the air velocity, temperature and humidity present in the duct.
Duct smoke detectors shall be connected to the building’s fire alarm
control unit when a fire alarm system is installed. Activation of a duct
smoke detector shall initiate a visible and audible supervisory signal at a
constantly attended location and shall perform the intended fire safety
function in accordance with this code and the California Mechanical Code.
Duct smoke detectors shall not be used as a substitute for required open
area detection.

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 14 of 36



(h)

Exception:

1. In occupancies not required to be equipped with a fire alarm
system, actuation of a smoke detector shall activate a visible and an
audible signal in an approved location. Smoke detector trouble conditions
shall activate a visible or audible signal in an approved location and shall
be identified as air duct detector trouble.

Section 907.6.2.2 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced
as follows:

907.6.2.2 Emergency voice/alarm communication system. Emergency
voice/alarm communication systems required by this code shall be
designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 72. The operation of any
automatic fire detector, sprinkler water-flow device or manual fire alarm
box shall automatically sound an alert tone followed by voice instructions
giving approved information and directions for a general or staged
evacuation in accordance with the building’s plans required by Section
404. In high-rise buildings having occupied floors located more than 55
feet, and Group I-2 occupancies having floors located more than 75 feet
(22 860 mm) above the lowest level fire department vehicle access, the
system shall operate on a minimum of the alarming floor, the floor above
and the floor below. Speakers shall be provided throughout the building by
paging zones. At a minimum, paging zones shall be provided as follows:

Elevator groups.

Exit stairways.

Each floor.

Areas of refuge as defined in Section 1002.1.
Dwelling Units in apartment houses.

Hotel guest rooms or suites.

SORALON =~

Exception: In Group I-1 and R-2.1 occupancies, the alarm shall sound in a
constantly attended area and a general occupant notification shall be
broadcast over the overhead page.

Section 907.7.3.2 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced
as follows:

907.7.3.2 High-rise buildings. In high-rise buildings having occupied floors
located more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access and Group I-2 occupancies having occupied
floors located more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above the lowest level fire
department vehicle access, a separate zone by floor shall be provided for
all of the following types of alarm-initiating devices where provided:

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 15 of 36



1)

Smoke detectors

Sprinkler water-flow devices

Manual fire alarm boxes

. Other approved types of automatic detection devices or
suppression systems

PON=

Section 910.3.2.2 of the 2010 California Fire Code is deleted and replaced
as follows:

910.3.2.2 Sprinklered Buildings. Where installed in buildings equipped
with an approved automatic sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall
be designed to operate automatically by actuation of a heat-responsive
device rated at least 100° F above the operating temperature of the
sprinkler, unless otherwise approved.

5131.10 Chapter 10, Means of Egress, of the 2010 California Fire Code is
adopted in its entirety without amendments.

5131.11 Chapter 11, Aviation Facilities, of the 2010 California Fire Code is
adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

(@)

(b)

Section 1102.1 of the 2010 California Fire Code is hereby amended by
adding the following definitions:

APPROACH-DEPARTURE PATH. The flight path of the helicopter as it
approaches or departs from the landing pad.

EMERGENCY HELICOPTER LANDING FACILITY (EHLF). A landing
area on the roof of a high rise building that is not intended to function as a
heliport or helistop but is capable of accommodating fire or medical
helicopters engaged in emergency operations.

SAFETY AREA. A defined area surrounding the landing pad which is free
of obstructions.

TAKEOFF AND LANDING AREA. The combination of the landing pad
centered within the surrounding safety area.

Section 1108 is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 1108
Emergency Helicopter Landing Facility (EHLF)

1108.1 General. Every building of any type of construction or occupancy
having floors used for human occupancy located more than 75 ft above
the lowest level of the fire department vehicle access shall have a rooftop
emergency helicopter landing facility (EHLF) in a location approved by the

Ordinance No. 1387
Page 16 of 36






